
Batavia Public School District 101

2024 Custodial Services Bid Tab
Sealed Bid Opening Held on March 12, 2024 at 2:00 PM

Rosalie Jones Administration Center

Rank Bidder FY25 Base Bid FY26 Base Bid FY27 Base Bid Bid Bond (Y/N) 3-Year Total
Multisystem Management Comp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Facilities 360 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Eco Clean Maintenance No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
Aramark No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

1 Smith Maintenance Company $1,282,091.00 $1,282,091.00 $1,282,091.00 Y $3,846,273.00
2 HES Facilities Management $1,457,861.20 $1,501,597.04 $1,546,644.95 Y $4,506,103.19 17.2%
3 Citywide Building Maintenance $1,534,189.09 $1,580,214.76 $1,627,621.20 Y $4,742,025.05 23.3%
4 ABM $1,542,505.00 $1,588,780.00 $1,636,443.00 Y $4,767,728.00 24.0%
5 GSF USA $1,568,644.70 $1,617,159.48 $1,667,174.72 Y $4,852,978.90 26.2%
6 GDI Facility Services $1,608,964.00 $1,657,233.00 $1,706,950.00 Y $4,973,147.00 29.3%
7 RNA Facilities Management $1,646,459.60 $1,694,953.39 $1,744,901.99 ? $5,086,314.98 32.2%
8 SSC Services $1,714,343.00 $1,765,784.00 $1,818,758.00 Y $5,298,885.00 37.8%


