

Item	Quantity	Unit	School Specialty	Really Good Stuff/Discount School Supply		Kits for Kidz		Pyramid Paper Company	Accurate Office Supply
			Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Notes	Price Per Unit	Notes	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit
1 1/2" Three Ring View Binder, White, Avery or Comparable	150	Each	\$1.70	no bid		\$4.3200		\$1.8900	\$2.0101
1" Three Ring View Binder, Black-Avery or Comparable	200	Each	\$1.55	\$3.51		\$3.8400		\$1.5900	\$1.3737
1" Three Ring View Binder, White-Avery or Comparable	1,200	Each	\$1.55	no bid		\$3.6200		\$1.5900	\$1.3737
12" Ruler with Inches/Centimeters	1,400	Each	\$0.16	\$0.61		\$0.2000		\$0.2000	\$0.5778
2" Three Ring View Binder, White-Avery or Comparable	400	Each	\$2.00	no bid		\$4.4800		\$2.0900	\$2.3434
Bazic Bright Color 3-Ring Pouch with Mesh Window, Multi Color or comparable brand	1,750	Each	\$0.59	\$6.06		\$0.8100		no bid	\$1.7534
Bazic Plastic Pencil Case Storage Box with lid snap, Clear or Multi Color, or comparable brand	1,200	Each	\$1.26	\$2.58		\$0.8600		\$1.3900	\$0.9022
Bic Round Stic Extra Precision Black Pens	550	Each	\$0.10	\$4.06		\$0.1500		no bid	\$0.0876
Bic Stic Grip Xtra Comfort Red Ball Point Pen	650	Each	\$0.17	no bid		\$0.1300		no bid	\$0.1749
Binder Tabs, Assorted Colors, 8-Tab	1,000	Each	\$0.47	no bid		\$0.5400		\$0.4400	\$0.6493
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 Wipes per container	400	Container	\$1.73	no bid		\$4.0800	only available in 70 ct; price reflects 70 ct	no bid	\$2.6023
Composition Book, 100 Pages	1,500	Each	\$0.90	\$2.78		\$0.9200		\$1.0900	\$0.8421
Copy paper, 11 x 17*	5	Case	\$54.28	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$47.3333
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, blue*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, buff*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, canary*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, goldenrod*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, green*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		\$15.3300	colored paper only available in packs of assorted pastel colors	no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, lavender*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, pink*	15	Case	\$59.80	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$66.0976
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, recycled*	800	Case	\$51.50	no bid		no bid		no bid	n/a
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 11, white*	800	Case	\$45.25	no bid		\$4.7800	emld to clarify price	no bid	\$46.8750
Copy paper, 8 1/2 x 14*	5	Case	\$67.81	no bid		no bid		no bid	\$60.1333
Crayola Classic Color Crayons, 24 Colors	3,700	Box	\$0.87	\$4.40		\$1.3500		\$0.7500	\$1.3262
Crayola Colored Pencils, Set of 12	1,700	Box	\$1.34	\$3.10		\$2.2300		\$1.1000	\$1.6042
Crayola Colors of the World Crayons, 24 Assorted Colors	350	Box	\$1.75	\$2.55		no bid		\$1.1900	\$1.5314
Crayola Ultra-Clean Washable Color Markers, Broad Tip, Assorted Classic Colors, Box Of 10	300	Box	\$3.76	\$6.39		\$3.4800		\$2.5900	\$2.3590
Crayola Ultra-Clean Washable Color Markers, Broad Tip, Assorted Classic Colors, Box Of 8	2,800	Box	\$1.89	\$5.23		\$3.0700		\$1.5500	\$2.7944
Crayola Washable Watercolor Paint, 16 Assorted Colors	400	Set	\$2.85	\$4.56		\$3.7100		\$2.1900	\$2.9091
Crayola Washable Watercolor Paint, 8 Assorted Colors	1,100	Set	\$1.68	\$2.94		\$1.9900		\$1.2500	\$1.7361
Dixon Ticonderoga Pre-Sharpened Pencil, HB (#2)	50,000	Each	\$0.19	\$8.49	set of 12	\$1.2200	only available in dozens	\$0.1600	\$0.1825
Dry Erase Lapboard 9" x 12"	1,000	Each	\$0.70	\$3.35		\$0.9600		\$0.8400	\$1.6441
Dry Erase Lapboard Mini Eraser	1,000	Each	\$0.77	\$1.98		\$1.2300		\$0.5900	\$0.9996
Elmer's All-purpose School Glue Stick	14,000	Each	\$0.42	\$15.99	set of 30	\$0.4600		\$0.3300	\$0.5523
Elmer's Washable School Glue, 4 oz, Dries Clear	700	Each	\$0.79	\$17.59	set of 12	\$0.6900		\$0.6200	\$1.0570
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Bullet Tip, Black	1,500	Each	\$1.12	no bid		\$1.7500		\$0.5500	\$0.8728
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Bullet Tip, Blue	750	Each	\$1.12	no bid		no bid		\$0.5500	\$0.7845
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Bullet Tip, Green	750	Each	no bid	no bid		no bid		what does disc mean	\$1.3883
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Bullet Tip, Red	750	Each	no bid	no bid		no bid		\$0.5500	\$0.7845
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Black	4,000	Each	\$1.12	\$13.39	set of 4	\$1.3600		\$0.5500	\$0.8703
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Blue	1,750	Each	\$1.12	no bid		\$1.3900		\$0.5500	\$0.8819
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Green	1,700	Each	\$1.12	no bid		\$1.3900		\$0.5500	\$0.8785
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Chisel Tip, Red	1,700	Each	\$1.07	no bid		\$1.3900		\$0.5500	\$0.8785
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Fine Point, Black	2,000	Each	\$0.95	no bid		\$1.0100		\$0.5000	\$0.7694
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Fine Point, Blue	750	Each	\$0.95	no bid		\$1.1500		\$0.5000	\$0.7711
Expo Low Odor Dry-Erase Marker, Fine Point, Red	750	Each	\$0.95	no bid		\$1.1500		\$0.5000	\$0.7958
Fiskars Soft-Grip Kids' Scissors, 5", Pointed	500	Pair	\$0.75	\$25.19	set of 12	\$1.8700		\$0.6000	\$0.6102
Fiskars, Soft Handle, 5", Blunt Tip	1,500	Each	\$0.76	\$27.99	set of 12	\$1.8100		\$0.6000	\$0.4191
Index Cards - White - Lined, 3" x 5", 100 Per Pack	700	Pack	\$0.35	\$1.37		\$0.5900		\$0.4400	\$0.5263
Kleenex-Professional Facial Tissue, 100 tissues per box	2,000	Box	\$0.62	\$1.40		\$1.5800	only available in 75 ct	no bid	\$1.3368

Item	Quantity	Unit	School Specialty	Really Good Stuff/Discount School Supply		Kits for Kidz		Pyramid Paper Company	Accurate Office Supply
			Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit	Notes	Price Per Unit	Notes	Price Per Unit	Price Per Unit
Loose Leaf Filler Paper, Wide Ruled, - 3 Hole punched, 200 Sheet Packs	1,000	Pack	\$1.42	\$3.04		\$1.3800	only available in 100 ct	\$1.8900	\$1.5222
Manual Double Hole Handheld Pencil Sharpener with Container	1,200	Each	\$0.56	\$1.19		\$0.3200		\$0.6500	\$0.9011
Mead Plastic Pocket Folder with Prongs, Assorted Colors (at least 5 colors)	5,700	Each	\$0.37	no bid		\$2.6300		no bid	\$0.3475
Mead Plastic Pocket Folder, No Prongs, Assorted Colors (at least 5 colors)	4,300	Each	\$0.30	no bid		\$2.3600		no bid	\$0.7500
Papermate Arrow Head Eraser Caps	7,000	Each	\$0.04	no bid		\$0.4300	only available in packs of 12	\$0.0300	\$0.3578
Papermate Flair Felt Tip Marker Pen, Black	800	Each	\$1.12	no bid		\$1.3900		\$0.6500	\$1.0235
Pink Pearl Eraser, Rectangular, Large	2,700	Each	\$0.48	\$15.49	set of 12	\$0.5800		\$0.0900	\$0.3410
Post It Notes 3" X 3", Yellow, 100 Sheets per pad	2,400	Each	\$0.20	no bid		\$1.3000		\$0.1900	\$0.2205
Sharpie Permanent Fine-Point Marker, Black	2,700	Each	\$0.71	\$11.94	set of 12	\$0.8100		\$0.4600	\$0.6078
Sharpie Pocket Style Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Yellow	2,300	Each	\$0.16	\$18.30	set of 12	\$0.7400		\$0.3500	\$0.4021
Single Subject College Ruled Spiral Notebook, Assorted Colors (at least 4 colors)	400	Each	\$1.45	no bid		\$0.8100		\$1.0900	\$1.0307
Single Subject Wide Ruled Spiral Notebook, Assorted Colors (at least 4 colors)	3,200	Each	\$0.72	\$2.74		\$0.8100		\$1.0900	\$1.3012
Ticonderoga Tri-Write Triangular No. 2 Pencils	7,000	Each	\$0.19	no bid		\$0.2200		\$0.1700	\$0.1815
Zip Lock Storage Bags, 1 Gallon	20,000	Single Bag	no bid	\$43.16	box of 250	\$1.2200	only available in boxes of 15 ct	no bid	\$0.0741
Zip Lock Storage Bags, Sandwich	25,000	Single Bag	no bid	no bid		\$1.1200	only available in boxes of 50 ct	no bid	\$0.0200
* Paper will be ordered throughout the year, quantity represents estimated order over course of the year.									